
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Turner Celebrates a Century of Building Hope and Healing 

In recognition of building healthcare facilities for 100 years, the Turner Construction Company Foundation will 
support the healthcare of the communities where we live and work.  

 
Georgia Baptist Hospital, Turner’s first healthcare project 

January 21, 2025 – Turner Construction Company is proud to commemorate 100 years of building healthcare 
facilities that support lifesaving care, foster healing, and bring comfort to patients and their families. 

As a leading healthcare builder in North America, Turner completes an average of $3.5 billion annually in healthcare 
projects. Our experience ranges from community hospitals to cutting-edge research centers. The company continues 
to innovate and build adaptable facilities that meet the evolving needs of modern medicine. 

Underscoring Turner’s dedication to fostering a healthier future for communities, the Turner Construction Company 
Foundation granted over one million dollars to healthcare related charities and organizations in 2024. The Foundation 
supports healthcare organizations in their efforts to address critical health challenges, improve access to care, and 
promote mental and physical well-being. This is the cornerstone of Turner’s 100 Years of Healthcare Commitment, 
which aims to strengthen the foundation of healthcare services and innovation for the next century. 
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“Turner is honored to contribute to building spaces where healing flourishes and people receive the care they need,” 
said Peter Davoren, Chairman and CEO. “This milestone is a testament to the vision of our clients, the passion of our 
people, and the trust we’ve earned over generations. Together, we’ve created environments that deliver care and 
offer hope.” 

 
New York City Economic Development Corporation, South Brooklyn Hospital, Ruth Bader Ginsburg Building. Photo by Max 
Touhey. 

“Our century-long commitment to healthcare construction is deeply rooted in Turner’s mission to enrich lives,” said 
Randy Keiser, National Healthcare Director. “We are privileged to have partnered with healthcare providers who trust 
us to deliver spaces that elevate patient outcomes. A testament to our dedication to achieving their vision is that 80% 
of our work is for repeat clients.”  

Keiser continued, “More than 2,000 Turner employees have experience on healthcare projects, and they truly 
appreciate the opportunity to be involved in this work. They look forward making a difference in the lives of others as 
they create spaces that empower healthcare professionals, support groundbreaking research, and transform patient 
care for future generations.” 

### 

About Turner Construction Company  

Our vision is to be the highest value provider of construction services. We deliver our services on complex and 
challenging building projects of all types and sizes throughout North America and in 30 countries around the world. 
We seek to create a healthy, prosperous, and sustainable future for our people, clients, partners, and the planet. We 
have earned a reputation for integrity, working safely, and driving innovation. With a focus on creating an 
environment where people can be at their best, be authentic, and be treated with respect and dignity, the company is 
widely recognized as a great place to work. The firm is a subsidiary of HOCHTIEF, an engineering-led global 
infrastructure solutions provider with leading positions in North America, Australia and Europe and a rapidly 



expanding presence in high-tech, energy transition and sustainable infrastructure markets. To learn more about 
Turner visit www.turnerconstruction.com. 
 
About The Turner Construction Company Foundation 
 
Established in 1983, the Turner Construction Company Foundation is a private non-profit organization. The 
foundation aims to construct and inspire change where we build. Through our local offices, the Foundation supports 
charitable organizations that promote active caring, wellness, workforce readiness, diversity, equity, and inclusion. 
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